
B7452
Pricing must remain firm for 12 months, and must 

include all costs including freight, the District will not 

pay any additional costs for products delivered.

Cascio Interstate 

Music, Inc Chuck Levins Percussion Source School Outfitters Taylor Music

ITEM# DMPS SKU# N050100280

1 DESCRIPTION

Risers, 3 steps, Wenger, 6'x18", black choral 

signature riser, with backrails, Wenger 

Corporation

1 ESTIMATED USAGE 5

1 MANUFACTURER NAME Wenger Corporation NOR NOR3LSR+

1 MANUFACTURER# Wenger Corporation No Bid No Bid No Bid Norwood Commercial

1 UOM each each each

1 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE

1 QUOTE PRICE $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $860.000 $0.000

ITEM# DMPS SKU# B050100290

2 DESCRIPTION

Risers, 4 step, Wenger, 6'x18", black choral 

signature riser, with backrails, Wenger 

Corporation

2 ESTIMATED USAGE 4

2 MANUFACTURER NAME Wenger Corporation NOR NOR4LRS+

2 MANUFACTURER# Wenger Corporation No Bid No Bid No Bid Norwood Commerical

2 UOM each each each

2 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE

2 QUOTE PRICE $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $1,020.000 $0.000

ITEM# DMPS SKU# NEW

3 DESCRIPTION Amplifier - keyboard, 180 watt, Roland KC-350

3 ESTIMATED USAGE 1

3 MANUFACTURER NAME Roland KC-350 as spec Cascio #

3 MANUFACTURER# Roland KC-350 AMPKC350 No Bid

3 UOM each each each

3 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE

3 QUOTE PRICE $406.900 $423.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

ITEM# DMPS SKU# N050101180

4 DESCRIPTION

Baritone Saxophone with case & MP, Yamaha 

Model YBS52, Full Size, YBS-52

4 ESTIMATED USAGE 3

4 MANUFACTURER NAME Yamaha YBS-52 as spec Cascio # No Bid Spec

4 MANUFACTURER# Yamaha YBS-52 EBSYBS52 Yamaha YBS-52

4 UOM each each each

4 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE

4 QUOTE PRICE $3,965.900 $3,954.000 $0.000 $0.000 $3,988.000

ITEM# DMPS SKU# N050101190

5 DESCRIPTION

Sousaphone, Jupiter, Fiberglass w/brass/laquer 

bell, MP & Case Model 696L, Full Size, Jupiter

5 ESTIMATED USAGE 1

5 MANUFACTURER NAME Jupiter 696L as spec Cascio # Jupiter 696L

5 MANUFACTURER# Jupiter 696L SOU696L JSP1010 No Bid As Spec
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5 UOM each

5 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE

5 QUOTE PRICE $3,074.900 $3,093.000 $0.000 $0.000 $3,085.000

ITEM# DMPS SKU# N050102603

6 DESCRIPTION

Euphonium, 4 value, .571 bore, 11" upright bell 

w/mouthpiece & case, Yamaha YEP-321-S

6 ESTIMATED USAGE 11

6 MANUFACTURER NAME Yamaha YEP 321-S as spec Cascio # Yamaha YEP321-S

6 MANUFACTURER# Yamaha YEP 321-S EUPYEP321S No Bid As Spec

6 UOM each

6 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE

6 QUOTE PRICE $1,834.900 $1,832.000 $0.000 $0.000 $1,844.000

ITEM# DMPS SKU# NEW
7 DESCRIPTION Sousaphone, Full Size, Jupiter 696S
7 ESTIMATED USAGE 1
7 MANUFACTURER NAME Jupiter 696S as spec Cascio # Jupiter 696S

7 MANUFACTURER# Jupiter 696S SOU96S JSP1010S No Bid As Spec

7 UOM each
7 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE

7 QUOTE PRICE $3,378.900 $3,399.000 $0.000 $0.000 $3,388.000

ITEM# DMPS SKU# NEW
8 DESCRIPTION Baritone, Marching, Yamaha YBH-301M
8 ESTIMATED USAGE 2
8 MANUFACTURER NAME Yamaha YBH-301M as spec Cascio # Yamaha YBH 301M

8 MANUFACTURER# Yamaha YBH-301M MBHYBH301M No Bid As Spec

8 UOM each
8 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE

8 QUOTE PRICE $1,571.900 $1,565.000 $0.000 $0.000 $1,566.000

ITEM# DMPS SKU# NEW
9 DESCRIPTION Trombone, Tenor, Yamaha YSL-354
9 ESTIMATED USAGE 2
9 MANUFACTURER NAME Yamaha YSL-354 as spec Cascio # Yamaha YSL 354

9 MANUFACTURER# Yamaha YSL-354 TBOYSL354 No Bid As Spec

9 UOM each
9 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE

9 QUOTE PRICE $434.900 $400.000 $0.000 $0.000 $409.000

ITEM# DMPS SKU# NEW
10 DESCRIPTION Tuba, Full Size, Yamaha YBB-201WC
10 ESTIMATED USAGE 2
10 MANUFACTURER NAME Tuba, Full Size, Yamaha YBB-201WC as spec Cascio # Yamaha YBB 201WC

10 MANUFACTURER# Tuba, Full Size, Yamaha YBB-201WC TUBYBB201WC No Bid As Spec

10 UOM each
10 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE
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10 QUOTE PRICE $3,865.900 $3,868.000 $0.000 $0.000 $3,862.000

ITEM# DMPS SKU# NEW
11 DESCRIPTION

Tuba, Three Quarter Size, Yamaha YBB-105WC
11 ESTIMATED USAGE 2
11 MANUFACTURER NAME

Tuba, Three Quarter Size, Yamaha YBB-105WC as spec Cascio # Yamaha YBB 105WC

11 MANUFACTURER#

Tuba, Three Quarter Size, Yamaha YBB-105WC TUBYBB105WC No Bid As Spec

11 UOM each
11 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE

11 QUOTE PRICE $2,516.900 $2,507.000 $0.000 $0.000 $2,519.000

ITEM# DMPS SKU# NEW
12 DESCRIPTION Clarinet, Yamaha YCL-255
12 ESTIMATED USAGE 3
12 MANUFACTURER NAME Clarinet, Yamaha YCL-255 as spec Cascio # Yamaha YCL 255

12 MANUFACTURER# Clarinet, Yamaha YCL-255 BCLYCL255 No Bid As Spec

12 UOM each
12 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE

12 QUOTE PRICE $341.400 $314.000 $0.000 $0.000 $313.000

ITEM# DMPS SKU# NEW
13 DESCRIPTION Flute, Yamaha, YFL-222
13 ESTIMATED USAGE 3
13 MANUFACTURER NAME Flute, Yamaha, YFL-222 as spec Cascio # Yamaha YFL 221

13 MANUFACTURER# Flute, Yamaha, YFL-222 FLUYFL221S No Bid this is the correct #

13 UOM each
13 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE

13 QUOTE PRICE $322.900 $326.000 $0.000 $0.000 $306.000

ITEM# DMPS SKU# NEW
14 DESCRIPTION

Saxaphone, Tenor, Full Size, Yamaha YTS-480
14 ESTIMATED USAGE 3
14 MANUFACTURER NAME

Saxaphone, Tenor, Full Size, Yamaha YTS-480 as spec Cascio # Yamaha YTS 480

14 MANUFACTURER#

Saxaphone, Tenor, Full Size, Yamaha YTS-480 BTSYTS480C No Bid As Spec

14 UOM each
14 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE

14 QUOTE PRICE $1,868.900 $1,864.000 $0.000 $0.000 $1,877.000

ITEM# DMPS SKU# NEW
15 DESCRIPTION Saxaphone, Alto, Yamaha YAS-480
15 ESTIMATED USAGE 4
15 MANUFACTURER NAME Saxaphone, Alto, Yamaha YAS-480 as spec Cascio# Yamaha YAS 480

15 MANUFACTURER# Saxaphone, Alto, Yamaha YAS-480 EASYAS480 No Bid As Spec
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15 UOM each
15 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE

15 QUOTE PRICE $1,623.900 $1,624.000 $0.000 $0.000 $1,633.000

ITEM# DMPS SKU# NEW
16 DESCRIPTION Trumpet, Yamaha YTR-2330
16 ESTIMATED USAGE 5
16 MANUFACTURER NAME Trumpet, Yamaha YTR-2330 as spec Cascio # Yamaha YTR 2330

16 MANUFACTURER# Trumpet, Yamaha YTR-2330 BTRYTR2330 No Bid As Spec

16 UOM each
16 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE

16 QUOTE PRICE $434.900 $400.000 $0.000 $0.000 $406.000

ITEM# DMPS SKU# N050102607
17 DESCRIPTION

Marimba, Adams Concert Series, Rosewood 

Marimba MCHV-43, 4 1/3 octaves
17 ESTIMATED USAGE 1
17 MANUFACTURER NAME

Adams MCKF43 as spec Cascio#

As Spec Installation 

available upon request

Adams MCKF43, not 

MCHV-43

17 MANUFACTURER#
Adams MCKF43 MARMCHV43 MCHV43 See notes for model info

17 UOM each
17 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE

17 QUOTE PRICE $5,040.900 $5,083.000 $3,607.000 $0.000 $3,633.000

ITEM# DMPS SKU# NEW
18 DESCRIPTION Timpano, 32 inch, Adams Professional Series 

Generaltion II Fiberglass
18 ESTIMATED USAGE 1
18 MANUFACTURER NAME

Adams as spec Cascio #

As Spec Installation 

available upon request Adams P2F132

18 MANUFACTURER# Adams TYMP2FI32 P2F132 As Spec

18 UOM each
18 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE

18 QUOTE PRICE $1,914.900 $1,918.000 $1,974.050 $0.000 $1,888.000

ITEM# DMPS SKU# NEW
19 DESCRIPTION Vibraphone, 3.0 Octaves, Adams Alpha, 

VAPT30M9G1
19 ESTIMATED USAGE 1
19 MANUFACTURER NAME

Adams Alpha as spec Cascio #

As Spec Installation 

available upon request Adams Alpha - Spec

19 MANUFACTURER# Adams Alpha VIBVAST30M9G1 VAST30M VAGT30M9T1 VAGT30M9G1

19 UOM each
19 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE

19 QUOTE PRICE $3,898.900 $3,929.000 $4,049.000 $0.000 $3,874.000



B7452
Pricing must remain firm for 12 months, and must 

include all costs including freight, the District will not 

pay any additional costs for products delivered.

Cascio Interstate 

Music, Inc Chuck Levins Percussion Source School Outfitters Taylor Music

ITEM# DMPS SKU# NEW
20 DESCRIPTION Clavinova, 88 key, Yamaha YDP-142
20 ESTIMATED USAGE 2
20 MANUFACTURER NAME Clavinova, 88 key, Yamaha YDP-142 as spec Cascio #

20 MANUFACTURER# Clavinova, 88 key, Yamaha YDP-142 SYSYDP142B No Bid No Bid

20 UOM each
20 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE

20 QUOTE PRICE $793.900 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

ITEM# DMPS SKU# NEW
21 DESCRIPTION Rogue Guitar
21 ESTIMATED USAGE 10
21 MANUFACTURER NAME Kathy Sub Archer AD10NA

21 MANUFACTURER# Guitar Center GTSAD10NA No Bid No Bid

21 UOM each
21 PREVIOUS YEAR PRICE

21 QUOTE PRICE $93.900 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Total Price: $85,372.700 $82,547.000 $9,630.050 $8,380.000 $80,878.000

Notes:

See attached notes, 

prices per quote, unless 

noted See notes, signed See notes See notes


